

**BID RESULTS**

**COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION**

BID OPENING DATE: 01/27/2015

JOB TITLE: **Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services (Feb. 1 - July 31, 2015)**

**IFB 14-15/P-60**

				<b>OFFICEMAX (A)</b>		<b>MAUI CHEMICAL (B)</b>	
<b>Section</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	
<b>KAUNOA</b>							
1	50 CASE	Southland foam tray, five compartment, 8" x 10", 500/case. TH1-0500, 5CMPT FOAM TRAY, TENNECO A) W710500 B) PACTIV	<u>\$49.60</u>	<u>\$2,480.00</u>	<u>\$54.75</u>	<u>\$2,737.50</u>	
2	50 CASE	Styrofoam tray with cover, medium, 3 compartments hinged lid, 200/case, TENNECO 80-215 A) W7NT3 B) HF1238S	<u>\$21.67</u>	<u>\$1,083.50</u>	<u>\$22.40</u>	<u>\$1,120.00</u>	
3	50 CASE	Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, 10 per case A) W7A10000825 B) #3650	<u>\$12.60</u>	<u>\$630.00</u>	<u>\$16.68</u>	<u>\$834.00</u>	
4	50 CASE	Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 1,000/case, 100/pkg., 10/case A) W7A10000840 B) #3652	<u>\$9.92</u>	<u>\$496.00</u>	<u>\$16.68</u>	<u>\$834.00</u>	
5	20 CASE	Dispenser napkin, 8" x 13-1/2", 10000/case, JR501 PY tall fold A) W6ST713 B) #98710	<u>\$39.50</u>	<u>\$790.00</u>	<u>\$65.35</u>	<u>\$1,307.00</u>	
6	10 CASE	Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4", 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 REYNOLDS A)W851215	<u>\$71.30</u>	<u>\$713.00</u>	<u>\$94.16</u>	<u>\$941.60</u>	
7	20 CASE	OEG-100, disposable gloves, large, 4650530, 10 boxes/case (prefer pop-up - no rolls) A) W815261 B) Foodhandler 104-FHCT16, 4650533	<u>\$27.90</u>	<u>\$558.00</u>	<u>\$18.40</u>	<u>\$368.00</u>	
8	20 CASE	Food tray, 1/2 lb., 1/1000 A) W7VFT50	<u>\$26.45</u>	<u>\$529.00</u>	<u>\$20.35</u>	<u>\$407.00</u>	
9	1 CASE	Food tray, 1 lb., 1/1000	<u>\$27.90</u>	<u>\$27.90</u>	<u>\$25.52</u>	<u>\$25.52</u>	

	A) W76151				
10	10 CASE Styrofoam bowls, 8oz. (F8 1100510) A) W78FC20	<u>\$52.10</u>	<u>\$521.00</u>	<u>\$50.00</u>	<u>\$500.00</u>
11	100 CASE Styrofoam cups, 6oz.,DART 6J6, 1000/cs A) W7686	<u>\$24.00</u>	<u>\$2,400.00</u>	<u>\$25.50</u>	<u>\$2,550.00</u>
12	60 CASE Plastic container, 5 oz. cup size, 1000/case #FK5CC A) W7FK5CC	<u>\$110.20</u>	<u>\$6,612.00</u>	<u>\$113.84</u>	<u>\$6,830.40</u>
13	60 CASE Lids for 5 oz. plastic container, 1000/case #L5CC A) W7L5CC	<u>\$41.50</u>	<u>\$5,490.00</u>	<u>\$102.70</u>	<u>\$6,162.00</u>
14	5 CASE Dawn, Joy, Palmolive dish detergent, 10-12 oz., assorted A) W346059	no bid		<u>\$41.55</u>	<u>\$207.75</u>
15	2 CASE Chopsticks, individual paper wrapped A) W777138 (4000/CASE) B) 4000/CASE	<u>\$82.78</u>	<u>\$165.56</u>	<u>\$67.76</u>	<u>\$135.52</u>
16	10 CASE Sugar, individual packets, 3000/case A) A700021 (1200/CASE) B) 2000/CASE	<u>\$17.69</u>	<u>\$176.90</u>	<u>\$13.67</u>	<u>\$136.70</u>
17	10 CASE Cream, 11 oz. (lite) A) A700020 (24/CASE)	<u>\$46.20</u>	<u>\$462.00</u>	no bid	
18	10 CASE Coffee, 8 oz., Decaffeinated A) A732420 B) 1151012 Kona	<u>\$44.10</u>	<u>\$441.00</u>	<u>\$30.57</u>	<u>\$305.70</u>
19	10 CASE Plastic Knife, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, 10 per case A) W7A10000830 B) #3651	<u>\$14.95</u>	<u>\$149.50</u>	<u>\$16.68</u>	<u>\$166.80</u>
20	1 CASE Plastic/wood coffee stirrers A) W737501	<u>\$1.90</u>	<u>\$1.90</u>	<u>\$26.42</u>	<u>\$26.42</u>
21	10 CASE 2-ply facial tissue, dispenser size, pop-up box A) W5HEMPFACIAL (30 BX/CASE) B) Georgia-Pacific #481	<u>\$27.50</u>	<u>\$27.50</u>	<u>\$35.08</u>	<u>\$35.08</u>
22	2 CASE Plastic disposable apron	<u>\$39.60</u>	<u>\$79.20</u>	<u>\$33.48</u>	<u>\$66.96</u>

		A) W815341 (500/CASE) B) 250-FH3L-CP (200/CASE)				
23	1 CASE	Laundry detergent, vending machine type, 8oz., assorted A) W360571	<u>no bid</u>		<u>\$69.48</u>	<u>\$69.48</u>
24	10 CASE	Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case A) A700291 B) 312/CASE	<u>\$6.40</u>	<u>\$64.00</u>	<u>\$11.33</u>	<u>\$113.30</u>
25	10 EACH	Coffee Percolators 20-35 cup A) A7CP30	<u>\$89.15</u>	<u>\$891.50</u>	no bid	
26	1 CASE	"Mini-grip", reclosable bag 4" width x 6" height A) W4F20406	<u>\$17.30</u>	<u>\$17.30</u>	<u>\$23.70</u>	<u>\$23.70</u>
27	1 CASE	Individually wrapped "moist towlelete" hand wipes A) W76700305 (1000/CASE)	<u>\$11.00</u>	<u>\$11.00</u>	<u>\$15.57</u>	<u>\$15.57</u>
28	10 CASE	Clorox, 16 oz. (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles A) W32071	<u>\$18.00</u>	<u>\$180.00</u>	<u>\$27.03</u>	<u>\$270.30</u>
29	2 CASE	Plastic Sandwich Bag 5"x6" Zip-Lock top A) W4H07RC B) 6"x6" 1000/case	<u>\$17.75</u>	<u>\$35.50</u>	<u>\$41.80</u>	<u>\$83.60</u>
30	5 CASE	Press & seal wrap, dispenser ty box A) W8VW182 18" roll x 2000' B) Glad 11.8"x140sq.ft., 10rolls/case	<u>\$16.40</u>	<u>\$82.00</u>	<u>\$13.40</u>	<u>\$67.00</u>
31	10 CASE	Biodegradable, covered 3 compartment food tray, paper. A) W7DPLA38 160/CASE B) ECO-8-3HW, 200/CASE	<u>\$46.90</u>	<u>\$469.00</u>	<u>\$48.64</u>	<u>\$486.40</u>
32	10 CASE	Paper plate; Valley, #22025 Valley, 5 compartment luau tray, 10-1/2 x 8-1/2 A) W7TL15 500/CASE B) #22028 12 1/2"x8 1/2", 500/CASE	<u>\$73.00</u>	<u>\$730.00</u>	<u>\$74.38</u>	<u>\$743.80</u>
33	5 CASE	Paper dinner plate, foam, non-sectional, 10 inch A) W7PL10 (500/CASE) B) #25776 10.5", 500/CASE	<u>\$64.80</u>	<u>\$324.00</u>	<u>\$94.16</u>	<u>\$470.80</u>

34	5 CASE	Cream, individual serving package A) A700022 800/CASE B) 1000/CASE	<u>\$20.25</u>	<u>\$20.25</u>	<u>\$12.60</u>	<u>\$12.60</u>
----	--------	--	----------------	----------------	----------------	----------------

**LANAI**

1	1 CASE	5 compartment lunch tray, foam 8" x 10" A) W710500 B) TH1-0500, 500/CASE	<u>\$58.00</u>	<u>\$58.00</u>	<u>\$64.61</u>	<u>\$64.61</u>
2	2 CASE	Plastic sandwich bag 8X8, 2.0 mil ZIPLOCK 1000/case A) W4F20808	<u>\$58.00</u>	<u>\$116.00</u>	<u>\$65.20</u>	<u>\$130.40</u>
3	10 CASE	Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, 10 packs/case A) W7A10000825	<u>\$14.50</u>	<u>\$145.00</u>	<u>\$18.51</u>	<u>\$185.10</u>
4	2 CASE	Dispenser napkins, 8" x 13-1/2", 10000/case, SCOTT 98710 A) W6ST713	<u>\$47.05</u>	<u>\$94.10</u>	<u>\$73.24</u>	<u>\$146.48</u>
5	1 CASE	Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4", 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 REYNOLDS A) W851215	<u>\$73.05</u>	<u>\$73.05</u>	<u>\$104.54</u>	<u>\$104.54</u>
6	20 CASE	Styrofoam deep trays with cover, 3 compartments, 200/case, AMOCO #80-663 A) W7DF883PB 150/CASE B) Pactiv, YHLW0803, 150/CASE	<u>\$27.00</u>	<u>\$540.00</u>	<u>\$30.18</u>	<u>\$603.60</u>
7	2 CASE	OEG-100 disposable gloves, large, 1000/case, 10 boxes/case, prefer pop-ups - no rolls A) W815261 B) Foodhandler, 104-FHCT16	<u>\$20.50</u>	<u>\$41.00</u>	<u>\$19.17</u>	<u>\$38.34</u>
8	4 CASE	Multi-fold paper towels, 9.4" x 9.25", white 4000/case A) W5ST199 B) Kimberly-Clark, #1804	<u>\$36.00</u>	<u>\$144.00</u>	<u>\$29.38</u>	<u>\$117.52</u>
9	4 CASE	Trash can liner, 33 gal., 33x39, low density poly, 1.75 mil, 200 bag/case A) K6PGB4051 100/CASE B) Island Plastic Bags, MB33	<u>\$39.00</u>	<u>\$156.00</u>	<u>\$48.32</u>	<u>\$193.28</u>
10	2 CASE	Toilet tissue, rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96 rolls/case	<u>\$69.00</u>	<u>\$138.00</u>	<u>\$71.10</u>	<u>\$142.20</u>

	A) W5HEMPBATH B) Kimberly-Clark #13217,506 shts/roll, 80 rolls/CASE				
11 10 CASE	Paper hot cup, with handle, 8oz., 1000/case A) W7SMR8 (NO NEED HANDLE 600/CS) B) Solo, 378HW Hot Cup	<u>\$70.00</u>	<u>\$700.00</u>	<u>\$88.33</u>	<u>\$883.30</u>
12 2 CASE	Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case A) W32071	<u>\$21.00</u>	<u>\$42.00</u>	<u>\$19.61</u>	<u>\$39.22</u>
13 20 CASE	Paper plates, M23-7992, diamond deluxe, 12 pkg-20 trays each, 10-1/2 x 8-1/2 x 1, 5 compartment, luau tray A) W7TL15 B) #22028 12 1/2" x 8 1/2"	<u>\$71.00</u>	<u>\$1,420.00</u>	<u>\$80.62</u>	<u>\$1,612.40</u>
14 4 CASE	Paper towel, roll, double ply A) W5ST852 B) Georgia-Pacific, #27300, 30/CASE	<u>\$34.00</u>	<u>\$136.00</u>	<u>\$43.63</u>	<u>\$174.52</u>
15 2 CASE	Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case A) A700291 B) 312/CASE	<u>\$7.75</u>	<u>\$15.50</u>	<u>\$12.46</u>	<u>\$24.92</u>
16 2 CASE	Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 100/pack, 10 packs/case A) W7A10000840	<u>\$11.00</u>	<u>\$22.00</u>	<u>\$18.51</u>	<u>\$37.02</u>
17 4 CASE	Press and seal wrap, dispenser type box A) W8VW182, 18" x 2000' B) Glad 11.8"x140sq.ft., 10rolls/case	<u>\$18.00</u>	<u>\$72.00</u>	<u>\$13.60</u>	<u>\$54.40</u>
18 20 CASE	Biodegradable, 3 compartment covered tray, paper A) W7 DPLA38A B) Bridge-gate, 8" ECO-8-3HW, 200/case	<u>\$57.00</u>	<u>\$1,140.00</u>	<u>\$49.43</u>	<u>\$988.60</u>
19 5 CASE	8oz. Styrofoam bowl A) W78FC20 B) DART, 8SJ20, 1000/CASE	<u>\$55.00</u>	<u>\$275.00</u>	60.24	301.2
20 5 CASE	8oz. Styrofoam bowl lid A) W7LVFC20 B) 20JL Vented Lid, 1000/CASE	<u>\$26.00</u>	<u>\$130.00</u>	<u>\$28.50</u>	<u>\$142.50</u>

21	2 CASE	Cream - Individual serving packet A) A700022 B) 1000/CASE	<u>\$24.80</u>	<u>\$49.60</u>	<u>\$13.28</u>	<u>\$26.56</u>
----	--------	---	----------------	----------------	----------------	----------------

**TOTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1  
THRU 21**

\$5,507.25

\$8,010.71

**KALAUPAPA AND KAUNAKAKAI**

1	10 CASE	Foam cups, 8 oz., foam cups, 1000/case A) W7888 B) DART 8J8	<u>\$32.00</u>	<u>\$320.00</u>	<u>\$39.94</u>	<u>\$399.40</u>
2	40 CASE	Styrofoam deep try with cover, 3 compartments, 200/case, AMOCO #80-663 A) W7DF883PB 150/CASE B) PACTIV YHLW0803 (150/CASE)	<u>\$27.00</u>	<u>\$1,080.00</u>	<u>\$30.18</u>	<u>\$1,207.20</u>
3	10 CASE	Southland foam trays, 5 compartments, 8" x 10", 500/case, AMOCO #70-255 A) W710500 B) PACTIV TH1-0500	<u>\$58.00</u>	<u>\$580.00</u>	<u>\$64.61</u>	<u>\$646.10</u>
4	4 CASE	Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, 10 packs/case A) W7A10000825	<u>\$47.05</u>	<u>\$188.20</u>	<u>\$18.51</u>	<u>\$74.04</u>
5	2 CASE	Plastic spoon, 5" 1000/case, LS-1, Winkler #947-005 A) W7A10000840 B) 100/pack, 10packs/CASE	<u>\$11.00</u>	<u>\$22.00</u>	<u>\$18.51</u>	<u>\$37.02</u>
6	2 CASE	Dispenser napkins, 8" x 12-1/2", 10000/case, SCOTT 98710 A) W6ST713 B) SCOTT 98710	<u>\$47.05</u>	<u>\$94.10</u>	<u>\$73.24</u>	<u>\$146.48</u>
7	2 CASE	Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4", 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 REYNOLDS A) W851215 B) PACTIV W69	<u>\$73.05</u>	<u>\$146.10</u>	<u>\$104.54</u>	<u>\$209.08</u>
8	2 CASE	OEG-100 disposable gloves, large, 1000/case, 10 boxes/case GAUN prefer pop- ups - no rolls A) W815261 B) FOODHANDLER 104-FHCT16	<u>\$20.50</u>	<u>\$41.00</u>	<u>\$19.17</u>	<u>\$38.34</u>

9 2 CASE	Multi-fold paper towel, 9.4" x 9.25", white, 4000/case A) W5ST199 B) #1804 KIMBERLY-CLARK	<u>\$36.00</u>	<u>\$72.00</u>	<u>\$29.38</u>	<u>\$58.76</u>
10 2 CASE	Toilet tissue: Kimberly Clark SS #0446, rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96/case, 45lbs., 4-1/2 x 4-1/2 A) W5HEMPBATH B) #13217 506sheets/roll, 80rolls/case	<u>\$69.00</u>	<u>\$138.00</u>	<u>\$71.10</u>	<u>\$142.20</u>
11 5 CASE	Tea bags, 100/box - 10/box - 10 boxes/case A) A700291 B) 312/CASE	<u>\$7.75</u>	<u>\$38.75</u>	<u>\$12.46</u>	<u>\$62.30</u>
12 10 CASE	Paper plate, #22025 Valley, 5 compartment luau tray A) W7TL15 B) #22028	<u>\$71.00</u>	<u>\$710.00</u>	<u>\$80.62</u>	<u>\$806.20</u>
13 10 CASE	Paper tray covered, biodegradable, 3 compartment A) W7DPLA38A B) 8" ECO-8-3HW (200/CASE)	<u>\$57.00</u>	<u>\$570.00</u>	<u>\$49.43</u>	<u>\$494.30</u>
14 2 CASE	Trash Liner, low-density 33x39 MB 33 A) K6PGB4051	<u>\$39.00</u>	<u>\$78.00</u>	<u>\$48.32</u>	<u>\$96.64</u>
15 2 CASE	Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case A) W32071	<u>\$21.00</u>	<u>\$42.00</u>	<u>\$19.61</u>	<u>\$39.22</u>
16 2 CASE	Plastic container, 5 oz. cup, FK5CC, 1000/case A) W7FK5CC	<u>\$114.00</u>	<u>\$228.00</u>	<u>\$118.60</u>	<u>\$237.20</u>
17 2 CASE	Plastic lid, for 5 oz. cup, L5CC, 1000/case A) W7L5CC	<u>\$94.00</u>	<u>\$188.00</u>	<u>\$107.70</u>	<u>\$215.40</u>
18 2 CASE	Sugar - individual packet, 2000/case A) A700021 (1200/CASE) B) 2000/CASE	<u>\$19.20</u>	<u>\$38.40</u>	<u>\$14.02</u>	<u>\$28.04</u>
19 2 CASE	Press and seal wrap, dispenser type, 10/140 sq. ft./case A)W8VW182 18" x 2000' B) Glad 11.8"x140sq.ft., 10rolls/case	<u>\$18.00</u>	<u>\$36.00</u>	<u>\$13.60</u>	<u>\$27.20</u>

TOTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1  
THRU 19

\$4,610.55

\$4,965.12

Tentative low bidder - In Bold

Bid Summaries emailed to:

Managing Director  
Director of Finance  
Corporation Counsel  
Council Chariman

Source of Funds:

Various

Opened by: Greg King 

Witnessed by: Jared Masuda 

  
Greg King, Central Purchasing Agent